

Attachment "A"

## 2016-2017 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

For the Period of April 1, 2016 through March 31, 2017

- Item 1 Liquid Asphalt
- Item 2 Gravel Products
- Item 3 Rock Products
- Item 4 Specialty and Mixed Asphalt Products
- Item 5 Concrete Products
- Item 6 Road Salt
- Item 7 Culvert Lining
- Item 8 Slope Stabilization Products

# 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

## Item 1: Liquid Asphalt Products

	Product listed as price per ton				Price List
	CSS-1	CCBC	CMS-2	CMS2-P	
<b>McAsphalt Industries Limited</b> 1.604.888.6262, Trent Gofers 19770 101 Avenue, Langley BC	\$ 414.00	\$ 414.00	\$ 414.00	\$ 509.00	No

	Product listed as price per ton				Price List
	CSS-1	CCBC	CMS-2	CMS2-P	
<b>Husky Marketing and Supply Company</b> 6685 Sierra Drive Kelowna, BC V1P 1A4	\$ 479.00	No Bid	\$ 481.00	\$ 549.00	No

# 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

## Item 2: Gravel Products

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Beaver Lake Quarry</b> 14322 Beaver Lake Rd Mount Vernon, WA 98273	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11.75	\$ 11.75	\$ 11.25	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Cemex</b> 22022 Mountain Loop Hwy Granite Falls, WA 98252	\$ 6.50	\$ 14.50	\$ -	\$ 9.50	\$ -	\$ 9.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Concrete Nor'West</b> 360.757.3121, S. Christianson Butler/Belleville Pit	\$ 6.50	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	\$ 6.70	\$ 13.00	\$ 25.50	Noted: 2"-8"	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Ericksen &amp; Svendsen Inc.</b> 360.466.1104, Arne Svendsen Wilbur Road, LaConner	Noted: 1 1/2" & 4" \$6.15&4.95	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	Noted: 2"-8" \$ 5.95	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Granite Construction Comp.</b> 360.239.0253, Ryan DeVries Conway Pit	\$ 4.75	\$ 19.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 7.75	\$ 12.75	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Green Crow Rock Products</b> 18633 SR 530 NE Arlington, WA 98223	\$ 5.50	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 6.50	\$ -	\$ 6.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 8.00	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>LB&amp;R Logging/AKA Casey's Pit</b> 360.708.8447, R. Hornbeck Marblemount	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4"- 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Lakeside Industries</b> 360.293.2168, Rod Gilmore Anacortes	\$ 8.65	\$ -	\$ 16.50	\$ 11.00	\$ -	\$ 11.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	Yes

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4" - 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Martin Marietta</b> 360.424.3441, Ira Taylor Pacific Quarry	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10.60	\$ 10.60	\$ 10.10	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	Yes

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4" - 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Skagit Aggregates, LLC</b> 360.420.6309, Steven Dahl Big Lake	\$ 4.75	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4" - 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Skagit Aggregates, LLC</b> 360.420.6309, Steven Dahl Big Rock	\$ 4.25	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8.00	\$ 10.00	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4" - 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Skagit Aggregates, LLC</b> 360.420.6309, Steven Dahl Day Creek	\$ 4.25	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5.00	\$ 7.50	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

Gravel	3/8"	1/2"	5/8"	3/4"	1 1/4"	Utility	Small	Fish	4" - 8"	Price
--------	------	------	------	------	--------	---------	-------	------	---------	-------

	Borrow	BST Chip	BST Chip	Crush Sfcg.	Crush Sfcg.	Crush Sfcg.	Road Sand	Drain Rock	Project	Cobbles	List
<b>Skagit Aggregates, LLC</b> 360.420.6309, Steven Dahl Rock Port	\$ 4.75	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12.00	\$ -	\$ 11.50	\$ 7.00	\$ 10.50	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Gravel Borrow	3/8" BST Chip	1/2" BST Chip	5/8" Crush Sfcg.	3/4" Crush Sfcg.	1 1/4" Crush Sfcg.	Utility Road Sand	Small Drain Rock	Fish Project	4" - 8" Cobbles	Price List
<b>Skagit Readymix/Smokey Point</b> 360.424.6970, Rod Hall MV and Arlington	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 13.00	\$ -	\$ -	No

## 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

### Item 3: Rock Products

Product listed as price per ton

	Pit Run Shot Rock	Light Loose Rip Rap	Heavy Loose Rip Rap	Armor Rock 5000#	1 Man Armor Rock	2 Man Armor Rock	3 Man Armor Rock	4 Man Armor Rock	5 Man Armor Rock	6-8" Minus	2-4" Minus	6" Minus	4" Minus	Reclyd 1.25" Minus	Price List
<b>Beaver Lake Quarry</b> 14322 Beaver Lake Rd Mount Vernon, WA	\$10.75	\$14.50	\$17.50	\$40.00	\$24.50	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$30.00	\$ -	\$11.50	\$ -	\$10.25	\$ -	Yes

Product listed as price per ton

	Pit Run Shot Rock	Light Loose Rip Rap	Heavy Loose Rip Rap	Armor Rock 5000#	1 Man Armor Rock	2 Man Armor Rock	3 Man Armor Rock	4 Man Armor Rock	5 Man Armor Rock	6-8" Minus	2-4" Minus	6" Minus	4" Minus	Reclyd 1.25" Minus	Price List
<b>CEMEX</b> 22022 Mountain Loop Hwy Granite Falls, WA	\$13.50	\$21.50	\$21.50	\$31.50	\$26.50	\$26.50	\$26.50	\$26.50	\$26.50	\$ -	\$9.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Pit Run Shot Rock	Light Loose Rip Rap	Heavy Loose Rip Rap	Armor Rock 5000#	1 Man Armor Rock	2 Man Armor Rock	3 Man Armor Rock	4 Man Armor Rock	5 Man Armor Rock	6-8" Minus	2-4" Minus	6" Minus	4" Minus	Reclyd 1.25" Minus	Price List
<b>Lakeside Industries</b> 360.293.2168, Rod Gilmore Anacortes	\$ 8.65	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$30.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$11.25	\$11.25	\$10.50	\$ -	\$ -	Yes

Product listed as price per ton

	Pit Run Shot Rock	Light Loose Rip Rap	Heavy Loose Rip Rap	Armor Rock 5000#	1 Man Armor Rock	2 Man Armor Rock	3 Man Armor Rock	4 Man Armor Rock	5 Man Armor Rock	6-8" Minus	2-4" Minus	6" Minus	4" Minus	Reclyd 1.25" Minus	Price List
<b>LB&amp;R Logging</b> 360.708.8447, Robert Hornbeck Marblemount	\$ 7.50	\$12.50	\$13.50	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$25.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	Pit Run Shot Rock	Light Loose Rip Rap	Heavy Loose Rip Rap	Armor Rock 5000#	1 Man Armor Rock	2 Man Armor Rock	3 Man Armor Rock	4 Man Armor Rock	5 Man Armor Rock	6-8" Minus	2-4" Minus	6" Minus	4" Minus	Reclyd 1.25" Minus	Price List
<b>Martin Marietta</b> 360.424.3441, Ira Taylor Pacific Quarry	\$ 9.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$11.00	\$10.50	\$ 9.00	\$9.00	\$9.10	Yes

# 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

## Item 4: Specialty and Mixed Asphalt Products

Product listed as price per ton

	ATB	HMA Class B	HMA Class G	Specialized PM Cold	Price List
<b>Cemex</b> 222 West Marine View Dr Everett, WA	\$ 63.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 66.00	\$ -	No

Product listed as price per ton

	ATB	HMA Class B	HMA Class G	Specialized PM Cold	Price List
<b>Granite Construction Company</b> 360.239.0253, Ryan DeVries Everett Plant	\$ 58.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 95.00	No

Product listed as price per ton

	ATB	HMA Class B	HMA Class G	Specialized PM Cold	Price List
<b>Lakeside Industries</b> 360.293.2168, Rod Gilmore Belleville Plant, Burlington	\$ 58.00	\$ 62.50	\$ 67.50	\$ 105.00	Yes

## 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

### Item 5: Concrete Products

Product listed as price per yard

	CDF Low Density Fill	5 SK 2500 PSI	5.5 SK 3000 PSI	6 SK 4000 PSI	7 SK 5000 PSI	Annular Space Neat Mix	Annular Space Sand Mix	Price List
<b>Concrete Nor'West</b> 360.757.3122, Scott Christianson Butler/Belleville	\$ 78.00	\$ 94.45	\$ 97.45	\$ 100.45	\$ 106.45	\$ 175.85	\$ 112.00	No

Product listed as price per yard

	CDF Low Density Fill	5 SK 2500 PSI	5.5 SK 3000 PSI	6 SK 4000 PSI	7 SK 5000 PSI	Annular Space Neat Mix	Annular Space Sand Mix	Price List
<b>Skagit Readymix/Smokey Point</b> 360.424.6790, Rod Hall Mount Vernon, Arlington	\$ 78.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 102.00	\$ 108.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 150.00	No

## 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

### Item 6: Road Salt

	Product listed as price per ton			Price List
	Color	Quantity	Price	
<b>Cargill, Inc Deicing Technology</b> 24590 Country Club Blvd Suite 450 N. Olmsted, OH 44070	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No

	Product listed as price per ton			Price List
	Color	Quantity	Price	
<b>EnviroTech Services, Inc.</b> 970.346.3900, Kimberly Field Othello	Ice Slicer Red	Not Listed	\$194.73	No

## 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

### Item 7: Culvert Lining

Product listed as price per foot

	Existing Culvert	HDPE Culvert Size	Standard Length	Price	Price List
<b>ISCO Industries (Snap-Tite)</b> 502.318.6632, Mac Horn Vancouver, WA	12"	10.75"	21'	\$28.50	Yes
	18"	14"	21'	\$40.33	
	24"	20"	24'	\$73.71	
	36"	32"	24'	\$166.27	
	48"	42"	24'	\$266.86	

## 2016 Spring/Summer Maintenance Material Bid Results

### Item 8: Slope Stabilization

Product listed as price per each or sf.

		Lengths	Estimated Quantity	Price	Price List	
<b>Hilfiker Retaining Walls</b> 800.762.8962, Bill Hilfiker Eureka, CA	2.5" Dia. Sch 80 Spiral Nails	10'	20 ea	\$129.35		
		12'	20 ea	\$151.80		
		14'	20 ea	\$174.24		
		16'	20 ea	\$196.68		
		18'	20 ea	\$219.11		
	6' Dia. Slope Spiders & Access.		80 ea	\$66.41		
	Wire Truss Panels & Access.	(4' tall is now our standard height for truss panels.)	1500 sq ft.	\$7.61/sf		
	Trinity Baskets (12'x2'x1. 5')		10 ea	\$253.47		No